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Coated Products Limited

Tarapur Works

B-8, Tatapur, M .1 .D .C Industrial Area,
Navapur Road, Boisar - 401 508,
Maharashtra, India.

CIN . U2N00MH1985PLCO37346
Phone : +91 2525270 147
FAX . +91 2525 270 148

Website @ wiww jswin

Date: 10* April'23

To,

The Principal,
Theem College of Engineering,

Boisar - 401501.

Subject: Sanction of Rs.50,000/- to Theem College of Engineering for the Research based project activity.

Dear Sir,

With reference to your proposal for supporting research-based project activity at your institute, we are
pleased to sanction a sum of Rs. 50,000/- for the same. The said amount will be processed and transferred to your
given account after deduction of TDS as per norms.

Thankyou.

Regards,

AGM - Digital & Sustainability

SW Steel Coated Products Limited

Regd. Office : JSW Centre,

Bandra Kurla Complex,
Bandra (East),

- @ Mumbai - 400 051

b CIN + U27100MH1985PLC037346
Phone : +91 2525270147

JWDAL  Partof OF. Jncalroup FAX  :+912525270 148
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CEQ & Managing Director,
Alimaan Charitable Trust,

Dongri, Mumbai - 400009,

Subject: - Appreciation Letter for your Grant-Financial Support provided.

Dear Sit/Madam.

As you know, we try each year to create memorab'e experiences as well as offer
unparalleleé technical educational opportunities for our students. Though we do have the best
possible infrastructure and resources to make th's possible by scaling their technical
knowledge through project based learning and other enriching experiences; however, with
cvery year the costs of necessary tools and students seems hard to create technical

project-based learning opportunitics.

We appreciate and want to say a heartful thanks to your esteemed organization for providing
e financial support of Rs.1,90,875/- to us for meeting the cducational needs that we have
received recently. Your recent financial support means so much to us and creates a positive
quality, best possible cducation and other enriching experiences to our striving students. The
impact that has created on our current students, and Theem COE cannot thank you enough for
the grant provided to our college.

We would iike 1o thank you once agan for this support provided and expect much
(o}
more such collaborations in the years to provide the good opportunities.
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To.

CEO & Managing Dhrector,

A F Kaleekat Educational and Welfare Trust

Morland Road, Mumbai, Maharashtra
Subject: - Appreciation Letter for your Grant-Financial Support provided.
Dear Sit/Madam,

As vou know, we try each year to create memorable experiences as well as offer
unparalleled technical educational opportunities for our students. Though we do have the best
ssible infrastructure and resources to make this possible by scaling their technical

POSS

snowledge through project based learning and other enriching experiences; however, with
every vear the costs of necessary tools and students seems hard to create technical projects

and learning cutting edge technologies.

We appreciate and want to say a heartful thanks to your estcemed organization for providing
the financial support of Rs. 3,56,000/- to us for meeting the educational needs that we have
recetved recenty. Your recent financial support means so much to us and creates a positive
guality, best possible education and other enriching experiences to our striving students. The
imipact that has created on our current students, and Theem COE cannot thank you enough for
the grant provided to our college.

We would like 1o thank you once again for this support provided and expect much
more such collaborations in the years to provide the good opportunities.

ﬁ COLLEGE UF ENGINEERING
cast) Tal. & Dist. Palghar- 401 501,

e B
Adme. Qifisa: 31C, Yusuf Dulicing, Vaer Maniman Noad, Fon, sduiabed - 400 525.
Tel.; 2204 6903 @ Telefax : 2283 9850 |
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Mohammed Wasim Khan <hod_mech@theemcoe.org>

Fwd: NAAC - Payment of Rs.30,000/-
1 message
Sat, Nov 4, 2023 at 12:12 PM

Emily Ghosh <fe_cod@theemcoe.org>
To: HOD_MECH <hod_mech@theemcoe.org>

.......... Forwarded message -----—--
From: Theem CoE <info@theemcoe.org>

Date: Sat, 30 Sept 2023, 11:39
Subject: Fwd: NAAC - Payment of Rs.30,000/-
To: <fe_cod@theemcoe.org>, <library@theemcoe.org>

----—----- Forwarded message ---------
From: J Kayani <accounts@theemcoe.org>
Date: Tue, Jul 25, 2023 at 1:41 PM

Subject: Re: NAAC - Payment of Rs.30,000/-
To: Theem CoE <info@theemcoe.org>

Amount of Rs.30000 received on 20/07/2023.



On Tue, Jul 25, 2023 at 1:31 PM Theem CoE <info@theemcoe.org> wrote:

i
i
H
£
|

Please verify.
Rana

---------- Forwarded message
From: NAAC Finance <naacfinance@gmail.com>

Date: Thu, Jul 20, 2023 at 5:02 PM
Subject: NAAC - Payment of Rs.30,000/-

To: <info@theemcoe.org>

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Thanking you.

For Finance Officer
NAAC, Bangalore
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Mohammed Wasim Khan <hod_mech@theemcoe.org>

Impact

Fwd: Sub: Release of Reimbursement Grants to Institutions under the
Lecture Series Scheme of IIC, MIC.
2 messages

Sat, Nov 4, 2023 at 12:15 P\

Dr. Riyazoddin Siddiqui <principal@theemcoe.org>
To: HOD_MECH <hod_mech@theemcoe.org>

-----——---- Forwarded message ---------
From: DEO Innovation Aamom.:,_:o<m:o:om__@m_.oﬂm-m:%m.o_.@v
Date: Thu, Feb 9, 2023 at 2:44 PM
Subject: Sub: Release of Reimbursement Grants to Institutions under the Impact Lecture Series Scheme of lIC,
MIC.
To:

@m_oﬁm-i%m.oﬁv, Udyan Maurya

Cc: Dipan Sahu <dipan.sahu@aicte-india.org>, selvarani <selva.rani
<startupfellow3@aicte-india.org>, ankush sharma Am:xcm:.m:mgm@m_ﬂm,_zamm.oﬁv_ Abhishek Ranjan
A_.::o<mmo:om_,om3@mmoﬁm-_.zamm,o_,@v“ Surendar R Amﬁm:cuﬁm__oéﬂ@m_Qm,msa_m.o_,@v_ Shubham Agrawal

<startupfellow1@aicte-india.org>

Dear Sir/madam,

Greetings of the day!



‘:m:w you for the patience, coordination and support.

As on the mcE.mo.H cited above, it is informed that the release of reimbursements to institutions have been made
as per the guidelines of the Impact Lecture Series scheme, IIC calendar year 2021-22.

You are requested to check the reimbursement amount credited to your institute’s account details provided in the
mnu:om:.o:. Sanction letter (hard copy) of the same will be sent to your institute address shortly and soon, a soft
copy of it also available for download in the IIC portal.

For any query related to above, please revert to us in this email and can reach to your zonal in-charge.

Thank you,

Institution’s Innovation Council
MoE’s Innovation Cell
AICTE, New Delhi

List of Institute (reimbursement) of IMPACT LECTURE.pdf

H 588K

Dr. Riyazoddin Siddiqui <principal@theemcoe.org>

To: HOD MECH <hod_mech@theemcoe.org>

Sat, Nov 4, 2023 at 12:15 PM



--—---—--- Forwarded message ---------
From: J Kayani Amooocﬂm@%mwsgoom.oﬁ@v

Date: Thu, Mar 9, 2023 at 6:42 PM

i of lIC,
Subject: Re: Sub: Release of Reimbursement Grants to Institutions under the Impact Lecture Series Scheme

To: Un Riyazoddin Siddiqui Auzzoﬁm_©5mm38m.oﬂ@v

Amount of Rs.12000 received from AICTE dt.06.02.2023 in IDBI Bank

On Thu, Mar 9, 2023, 17:57 Dr. Riyazoddin Siddiqui <principal@theemcoe.org> wrote:
' Pl verify if we received Rs 12000/ from govt.

' Rana
. [Quoted text hidden]
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G H Raisoni Institute of Business

Maharashtra

I 116 1C202015497 ki 5
dnageme
’ 117 1C201811899 ANNAMACHARYA INSTITUTE OF Andhra Pradesh
TECHNOLOGY & SCIENCE, RAJAMPET
118 1C202014291 Lakshmi Narain College of Madhya Pradesh
Pharmacy,Bhopal
119 1C202015121 Indore Institute of Pharmacy Madhya Pradesh
120 lc201810831 COIMBATORE INSTITUTE OF Tamll Nadu
ENGINEERING AND TECHNOLOGY
121 1C202115976 Vivek College of Commerce Maharashtra
122 IC201811791 | {lieém College of Engineering 17 Maharashtra
123 1C202014302 Stella Mary's College of Engineering Tamil Nadu
Gayatri Vidya Parishad Coll fi
124 1C201810240 ya Farls gLk h
Degree and PG Courses(A) Andhts Preies
125 1C202116145 VINAYAKA MISSION'S HOMOEOQOPATHY Tamil Nadu
MEDICAL COLLEGE AND HOSPITALS
126 1C202014260 Shadan College of Engineering & Telangana
Technology
127 1C202014882 Smt. Radhadevi Goenka Mahila
Mahavidhyalaya Miaharasatm
PRINCIPAL K. M. KUNDNANI COLLEGE
128 1C202015232
OF PHARMACY Maharashtra
129 1C202115640 THE COCHIN COLLEGE Kerala
130 1201912048 Ahalia School of Engineering and Kerala
Technology
131 1C202216694 JP College of Engineering Tamil Nadu
132 1C202116017 ANNAI HAJIRA WOMENS COLLEGE Tamil Nadu
133 1C202115670 MARWADI UNIVERSITY Gujarat
134 (07115886 Sv\faml Vivekananda Institute of WestBengsl
Science & Technology
Vivekanand Education Societys
135 1C201810310 Institute of Management Studies and Maharashtra
Research
136 1C202014464 St Peter's Engineering College Telangana
137 1C201912060 1C201912060 Maharashtra
138 1C201912828 BISWANATH COLLEGE Assam
Shri Shankarcharya Group of ]
139 1C201810804 Institutions Chhattisgarh
SRI INDU INSTITUTE OF ENGINEERING
140 1C202014316 AND TECHNOLOGY Telangana
Modern Institute of Pharmaceutical
141 1€201912154 Bl Madhya Pradesh
_ Nagpur Institute of Technology,
142 1C202014275 Na:ﬁur Maharashtra
143 1C201810829 DD Jain Memorial College for Women Punjab
Vidya Pratishthans Arts Science and
Maharashtra
144 €202014607 Commerce College. _
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To.

The Principal,

Theem College of Engineering, Boisar-401501.

Contord Praducts Lisnitad
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Phisie 91 2598 37 1y S
FAX a1 2828 2719 143

Vimbites WA e

Date: 17" Jan 2020

Subject: Sanction of Rs. 12,000/- to Theem College of Engineering for the Research

based project activity.

Dear Sir,

}Nstf_z reference to your proposal for supporting research-based project activity at your
institute, we are pleased to sanction a sum of Rs. 12,000/- for the same. The said amount
will be processed and transferred to your given account after deduction of TDS as per

norms.

Thank you

Regards,

Mr. Ama Singh
AGM - Digital & Sustainability

JSW Steel Coated Products Limited

F3 I
=
t

JINDAL  Partof OP. Jindal Group

Regd, Office : JSW Centre,
Bandra Kuila Complex,
Bandra (East),

Mumbai - 400 051

CIN + UZ7100MH1985PLCO3T348
Phone  : +91 2525 270 147
FAX : +01 2525 270 148



Theem College of Engineering
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Success... through
quality education !

Village Betegaon, Boisar Chilhar Road, Boisar (East), Tal. & Dist. Palghar - 401 501.
Tel 7769916109 @ Telefax . (025625) 284 927 @ Email : info@theemcoe.org @ Website : www.theemcoe.org

Re¢ Nos- teg fest [00-2)1[65R Datt) 2€/68/2020

lo.

CEO & Managime Director,

Modem Educational Social And Cultural Organization,

Mahim West Mumban - 400016, Maharashtra

Subject. = Appreciation Letter for your Grant-Financial Support provided.
Dear Sur Madam,

As you know, we try each year to create memorable experiences as well as offer
unparalleled technical educational opportunities for our students. Though we do have the best
possible infrastructure and resources to make this possible by scaling their technical
Anowledge through project based learning and other enriching experiences; however, with
cvery vear the costs of neeessary tools and students seems hard to create technical projects

and learning cutting edge technologies.

Weappreerate and want to say a heartful thanks to your esteemed organization for providing
the financial support of Rs.1,30,000/- to us for meeting the educational needs that we have
recenved recently. Your recent financial support means so much to us and creates a positive
quahity. best possible cducation and other enriching experiences to our striving students. The
impact that has created on our current students, and Theem COE cannot thank you enough for

the erant provided to our college.

We would like to thank you once again for this support provided and expect much

more such collaborations in the years to provide the good opportunities.

Admn. Office : 310, Yusuf Building, Veer Nariman Road, Fort, Mumbai - 400 023.
Tel.: 2204 6903 @ Telefax : 2283 9850
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To.

The Principal,

Theem College of Engineering, Boisar-401501.

Coanten? Provfuets Limitod

Tarapur Warey
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Date: 2™ Jan 2019

Subject: Sanction of Rs. 12,000/- to Theem College of Engineering for the Research

based project activity.

Dear Sir,

With reference to your proposal for supporting research-based project activity at your
institute, we are pleased to sanction a sum of Rs. 12,000/- for the same. The said amount
will be processed and transferred to your given account after deduction of TDS as per

norms.

Thank you

Regards,

Mr, A p Singh

AGM - Digital & Sustainability

JSW Steel Coated Products Limited

ANDAL  Partof O.P. Jindal Group

Regd. Office : JSW Ceantre,
Bandra Kuda Complex,
Bangra (Easl),

Mumbal - 400 051

CIN H UZ?IOOMHI?SSPLCBS?JM
Phone . +p1 2525 270 147
FAX - +91 2525 270 148



Theem College of Engineering
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To,

CEO & Managing Director,
Rajasthani Mushim Samaj Trust
NMuombai, Maharashtra,

Subject: - Appreciation Letter for your Grant-Financial Support provided.

Dear SirMadam,

As vou know, we try cach year to create memorable expericnces as well as offer
unparalleled technical educational opportunities for our students. Though we do have the best
possible intrastructure and resources to make this possible by sc
knowledge through project based learning and other cnriching

every vear the costs of necessary tools and students seems h
and learning cutting edge technologics.

aling their technical
experiences; however, with
ard to create technical projects

We appreciate and want 1o say a heartful thanks to your esteemed org
the financial support of Rs.2,93.091/- to us for meeting the educ
received recently. Your recent financial SUpport means so much to us and creates a4 positive
quahty, best possible education and other enriching experiences to our striving students. The

impact that has created on our current students, and Theem COE cannot thank you ¢nough for
the grant provided 10 our college.

antzation for providing
ational needs that we have

We would like to thank you once

again for this Support provided and expect much
more such collaborations in the ye

ars to provide the good opportunities.
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HEEM COLLEGE JF ENG!NEER!NG
SISar (Eacyy T & Dist. Palghar. 401 501
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Tel.: 2204 6903 @ Telefax : 2283 9850



H. J. Thim Trust's

Theem Collcge of Engineering

Approved by AICTE (New Deihi), Government of Maharashtra & DTE
Affiliated to University of Mumbai & MSBTE
"A NAAC Accredited Institute”

Success... through
quality education !

Village Betegaon, Boisar Chilhar Road, Boisar (East), Tal. & Dist Palghar - 401 501
Tel.: 7769916109 @ Telefax . (02525) 284 927 @ Email . info@theemcoe.org @ Welm_lte_ www.lheemme.org_

Date L 1§ [ o no|q

Re§ Mo Tee [€3r(1¢4-20/2 30A

lo,

CEO & Managing Director,

Fazlani Aishabai and Haji Abdul Latif Charitable,

Il Hospital Road. Byculla, Mumbai, Maharashtra - 400008.

Subject: - Appreciation Letter for your Grant-Financial Support provided
Dear Sir/Madam,

As you know. we try each year to create memorable experiencer as well as offer
unparalleled technical educational opportunities for our students. Though we do have the best
possible infrastructure and resources to make this possible ks scaling their technical
Knowledge through project based learning and other enriching expericnces; however, with
every year the costs of necessary tools and students seems hard to create technical projects
and learning cutting edge technologies.

We appreciate and want to say a heartful thanks to your esteemed organization for providing
the financial support of Rs.2,08,440/- to us for meeting the educational needs that we have
received recently. Your recent financial Stpport means so much to us and creates a positive
quality, best possible education and other enriching experiences to our striving students. The
impact that has created on our current students, and Theem COE cannot thank you enough for
the grant provided to our college.

We would like to thank you once again for this support provided and expect much
more such collaborations in the years to provide the good opportunities.

Sincer

IEEM COLLEGE JF ENGINEERING
sar (East) Tal. & Disl. Palghar- 401 501

~ Admn. Office : 310 Yusif Ryjilding, Vaer Narimen Read, Fert, Mumbzi 433 oon
Tel.: 2204 6903 @ Telefax : 2283 9850 o g
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forwa:- =i A R0%0-3 FHAAT USfrT VAT VAT A18 FTAT=AT Fery faferer summman whiht
FIVIHRAT EVIAT T WGaT F0ETE. (School Connect Program)
HeH:- 2, I7 HIAIAAI U 5. TS/ ferehTe/eTel/2032/033 T8, 0¢.03.0%2.
R. T . 0%.03. 032 TSIET HAGT HTe ST T,

ORISR [T ST Ve 9 2032-33 AT T STATHERHIEAT Welvld a6 & AT TR 2o af Tawd
Tereromr=an fermmeataT & wiean T School Connect Program =1 WW'H@FT E"I@FG’W HITATHRA School
Connect Program ¥ I Sh{viser HE1g U5 502, 3753 e 04T 3776 &1,

AT FTHE 31 R School Connect Program TAT SIS F.40,000/- (H&H- TGF T=TH TR &)
SUTETA VAW H 0 A . A F.2000/-(WiT WST) AN Wpet ol WO (e o yiEgrEE) o
%.3000/- T YMBTHE HIHHATY SIS TSV AR, Tedeh el Tedel HIAHHTE AR Flae! Hrasmame
AT Yo ferameatet Suferdr SuT et TR, TeIe B S ST hedTd S @, Ve, ST,
WhHET, R, WU o SRiter derdie AHYATEHIAT S0 AT, TA School Connect Program o AT o ATl
e Ul 3 A7 HTCETT W& FIE. STUiehe g1 S gvn=ar @erel Siaqe A AT oA 38, 399
TN WX HIE, (FHAT Fad el 3.
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A, e, OF T SeeATed, Hag 9t €.30.00.303¢ UHTHIG URATE A 7 § A AUE FeATTHI0 A1 HETGIR
FYHTAIET WIEY AT, School Connect Program Tﬁ AT HES=T Portal 3 I&@T Toremeatst nﬂ%?-ﬁ RO
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FHEIEETE FIHSTH 6 e STEdTe T HEAE T &, 2U.03, 2032 Td IR HI0A I1dT 8 qaewe! 9aT
IUHTTEETE HTEET 53 RS STEaTe Je o] I1 Shaierard WIed SHIvaT JTel.
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